
ABOUT THE CAST
José Angulo (Duarte) is an 
actor from San Francisco 
who studied theatre at 
Hope College in Holland 
Michigan. This will be his 
third consecutive show 
with Big Idea Theatre. 
Previous works include 
Matthew Timmins in 
BERTHA’S BOOKS and 
Demetrius in TITUS 
ANDRONICUS. He would 
like to dedicate the run 
of this performance to his 
wonderful wife Alondra 
Monrroy who has been 
his greatest support and 
muse throughout the 
whole process.

Pano Roditis (Sr. Costa) 
(he/they) is an actor, 
director, and sound 
designer based in 
Sacramento. Pano 
has previously worked 
with Teatro Nagual, 
Sacramento Theatre 
Company, Capital 
Stage, B Street Theatre, 
and Matriarchy Theatre. 
They have most recently 
performed in the world 
premiere of WAITING 

FOR GODINEZ at Teatro 
Espejo. Pano graduated 
from CSU Sacramento 
with a theatre major and 
computer science minor 
and plans on pursuing 
a PhD in performance 
studies studying the 
overlap between 
performance and games.

Lorena Rodriguez (Sra. 
Costa) is excited to be 
joining “The River Bride” 
with Big Idea Theatre. She 
previously performed in 
JUST A PINCH (Matriarchy 
Theatre), WAITING 
FOR GODINEZ, and 
LANGUAGE OF FLOWERS 
(Teatro Espejo). Before 
acting, she used theatre 
as a tool for healing and 
social change. A poet 
and multidisciplinary 
visual artist, Lorena is 
deeply grateful for the 
opportunity to create 
alongside such an 
inspiring team—and she’s 
happy to give her all on 
stage!
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